CHAPTER 2021-113

Committee Substitute for Committee Substitute for
Committee Substitute for House Bill No. 1209

An act relating to the Department of Financial Services; amending s. 20.121,
F.S.; specifying powers and duties of the Division of Public Assistance
Fraud; amending s. 284.30, F.S.; requiring the State Risk Management
Trust Fund to provide insurance for certain firefighter cancer-related
benefits; making technical changes; amending s. 284.31, F.S.; requiring
the Insurance Risk Management Trust Fund to provide a separate account
for certain firefighter cancer-related benefits; making technical changes;
amending s. 284.385, F.S.; specifying conditions that must be met before
certain firefighter cancer-related benefits may be paid from the State Risk
Management Trust Fund; making technical changes; creating s. 284.45,
F.S.; prohibiting individuals working for entities covered by the State Risk
Management Trust Fund from engaging in retaliatory conduct against
sexual harassment victims; defining the term “sexual harassment victim”;
specifying a criminal penalty for the willful and knowing dissemination of
a sexual harassment victim’s personal identifying information, except
under certain circumstances; amending s. 497.101, F.S.; revising member-
ship and terms of the Board of Funeral, Cemetery, and Consumer Services
within the Department of Financial Services; authorizing the use of
communications media technology for board member participation;
defining the term “communications media technology”; deleting a require-
ment for the department to adopt certain rules; amending s. 497.157, F.S.;
prohibiting unlicensed persons from acting as or advertising themselves
as funeral directors, embalmers, direct disposers, or preneed sales agents
unless they are so licensed; providing penalties; amending s. 497.159, F.S.;
conforming a provision to changes made by the act; amending s. 497.273,
F.S.; authorizing a cemetery company to sell specified items for use on
cemetery lands other than lands the company owns; amending s. 497.375,
F.S.; authorizing licensed funeral director interns to continue performing
certain tasks while transitioning to licensed funeral directors; amending s.
497.377, F.S.; authorizing licensed combination funeral director and
embalmer interns to continue performing certain tasks while transition-
ing to licensed combination funeral director and embalmers; amending s.
497.458, F.S.; specifying that certain deposits under preneed contracts for
funeral services or merchandise or burial services or merchandise must be
made unless the preneed contracts have been fulfilled; amending s.
497.550, F.S.; requiring monument retailers to comply with specified
requirements relating to place of business and operations; subjecting
monument retailers to inspection; amending s. 552.081, F.S.; revising the
definition of the term “two-component explosives” for the purpose of
regulation by the Division of State Fire Marshal;, amending s. 553.7921,
F.S.; authorizing a contractor repairing certain existing fire alarm
systems to begin work after filing an application for a required permit
but before receiving the permit; providing construction; amending s.

1
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2021-113 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2021-113

626.2815, F.S.; revising continuing education requirements for certain
persons licensed to solicit, sell, or adjust insurance; amending s. 626.371,
F.S.; requiring submission of renewal appointments of certain insurance
representatives within a certain timeframe; requiring the department to
notify certain insurers or employers regarding inadvertent failures to
appoint; requiring insurers and employers to pay certain fees and taxes
within a certain timeframe; authorizing the department to issue appoint-
ments under certain circumstances; prohibiting the department from
considering inadvertent failures to appoint to be violations under certain
circumstances; requiring the department to suspend an insurer’s or
employer’s authority to appoint licensees under certain circumstances;
amending s. 626.7351, F.S.; revising the qualifications for customer
representative licenses; amending s. 626.8443, F.S.; increasing the
maximum period of suspension of a title insurance agent’s or agency’s
license; making technical changes; amending s. 626.916, F.S.; deleting a
requirement for agents to advise insureds that certain coverage may be
available for personal residential property risks to be eligible for export
under the Surplus Lines Law; establishing conditions under which
coverage for indemnity of property insurance deductibles may be exported
to surplus lines; amending s. 626.9551, F.S.; prohibiting requirements for
the provision of replacement cost estimators or certain other proprietary
business information under certain circumstances; amending s. 627.715,
F.S.; providing an exemption from a diligent effort requirement for
surplus lines agents exporting contracts or endorsements providing
flood coverage; amending s. 633.102, F.S.; revising the authority of certain
fire protection system contractors to design or alter certain fire protection
systems; providing for resolution of conflicts between the Florida Building
Code and the Florida Fire Prevention Code; amending s. 633.136, F.S.;
replacing fire protection agencies in the Fire and Emergency Incident
Information Reporting Program with fire service providers; revising the
composition of the Fire and Emergency Incident Information System
Technical Advisory Panel;, defining the term “fire service provider”;
amending s. 633.202, F.S.; extending a deadline for certain buildings to
comply with a minimum radio signal strength requirement under the
Florida Fire Prevention Code; extending a deadline for certain buildings to
apply for a specified permit; creating s. 633.217, F.S.; prohibiting certain
acts to influence a firesafety inspector to violate certain laws; prohibiting a
firesafety inspector from knowingly and intentionally requesting, solicit-
ing, accepting, or agreeing to accept compensation offered to induce a
violation of certain codes, rules, or laws; amending s. 633.304, F.S.;
revising the training requirements for licenses and permits to install or
maintain fire suppression equipment; amending s. 633.402, F.S.; revising
the composition of the Firefighters Employment, Standards, and Training
Council; amending s. 633.416, F.S.; providing that certain persons serving
as volunteer firefighters may serve as regular or permanent firefighters
for a limited period, subject to certain restrictions; amending s. 648.30,
F.S.; prohibiting the aiding or abetting of unlicensed activity of a bail bond
agent or temporary bail bond agent; providing criminal penalties;
amending s. 843.08, F.S.; prohibiting false personation of personnel or

2
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2021-113 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2021-113

representatives of the Division of Investigative and Forensic Services;
amending s. 943.045, F.S.; revising the definition of the term “criminal
justice agency” to include the investigations component of the department
which investigates certain crimes; providing effective dates.

Be It Enacted by the Legislature of the State of Florida:

Section 1. Paragraph (f) of subsection (2) of section 20.121, Florida
Statutes, is amended to read:

20.121 Department of Financial Services.—There is created a Depart-
ment of Financial Services.

(2) DIVISIONS.—The Department of Financial Services shall consist of
the following divisions and office:

(f) The Division of Public Assistance Fraud, which shall function as a
criminal justice agency for purposes of ss. 943.045-943.08. The division shall
conduct investigations pursuant to s. 414.411 within or outside of the state
as it deems necessary. If, during an investigation, the division has reason to

believe that any criminal law of the state has or may have been violated, it
shall refer any records supporting such violation to state or federal law

enforcement or prosecutorial agencies and shall provide investigative
assistance to those agencies as required.

Section 2. Section 284.30, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

284.30 State Risk Management Trust Fund; coverages to be provided.
A state self-insurance fund, designated as the “State Risk Management
Trust Fund,” is created to be set up by the Department of Financial Services
and administered with a program of risk management, which fund is to
provide insurance, as authorized by s. 284.33, for workers’ compensation,
general liability, fleet automotive liability, federal civil rights actions under
42 U.S.C. s. 1983 or similar federal statutes, benefits payable under s.
112.1816(2), to an employee of a state agency or department covered under s.
284.31, and court-awarded attorney atterney’s fees in other proceedings
against the state except for such awards in eminent domain or for inverse
condemnation or for awards by the Public Employees Relations Commission.
A party to a suit in any court, to be entitled to have his or her attorney
atterney’s fees paid by the state or any of its agencies, must serve a copy of
the pleading claiming the fees on the Department of Financial Services; and
thereafter the department shall be entitled to participate with the agency in
the defense of the suit and any appeal thereof with respect to such fees.

Section 3. Section 284.31, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

284.31 Scope and types of coverages; separate accounts.—The Insurance
Risk Management Trust Fund must shall, unless specifically excluded by
the Department of Financial Services, cover all departments of the State of
Florida and their employees, agents, and volunteers and must shall provide

3
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2021-113 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2021-113

separate accounts for workers’ compensation, general liability, fleet auto-
motive liability, federal civil rights actions under 42 U.S.C. s. 1983 or similar
federal statutes, state agency firefighter cancer benefits payable under s.
112.1816(2), and court-awarded attorney atterney’s fees in other proceed-
ings against the state except for such awards in eminent domain or for
inverse condemnation or for awards by the Public Employees Relations
Commission. Unless specifically excluded by the Department of Financial
Services, the Insurance Risk Management Trust Fund must shall provide
fleet automotive liability coverage to motor vehicles titled to the state, or to
any department of the state, when such motor vehicles are used by
community transportation coordinators performing, under contract to the
appropriate department of the state, services for the transportation
d1sadvantaged under part I of chapter 427 Such fleet automotive liability
coverage is shall be primary and is shall-be subject to theprevisiens—of s.
768.28 and parts II and III of chapter 284, and applicable rules adopted
thereunder, and the terms and conditions of the certificate of coverage issued
by the Department of Financial Services.

Section 4. Section 284.385, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:
284.385 Reporting and handling of claims.—

(1) All departments covered by the State Risk Management Trust Fund
under this part shall immediately report all known or potential claims to the
Department of Financial Services for handling, except employment com-
plaints that whieh have not been filed with the Florida Human Relations
Commission, Equal Employment Opportunity Commission, or any similar
agency. When deemed necessary, the Department of Financial Services shall
assign or reassign the claim to counsel. The assigned counsel shall report
regularly to the Department of Financial Services or to the covered
department on the status of any such claims or litigation as required by
the Department of Financial Services. Ne Such claims may not elaim-shall be
compromised or settled for monetary compensation without the prior
approval of the Department of Financial Services and prior notification to
the covered department. All departments shall cooperate with the Depart-
ment of Financial Services in its handling of claims. The Department of
Financial Services and the Department of Management Services, with the
cooperation of the state attorneys and the clerks of the courts, shall develop a
system to coordinate the exchange of information concerning claims for and
against the state, its agencies, and its subdivisions, to assist in collection of
amounts due to them. The covered department is responsible shall-have-the
responsibility for the settlement of any claim for injunctive or affirmative
relief under 42 U.S.C. s. 1983 or similar federal or state statutes. The
payment of a settlement or judgment for any claim covered and reported
under this part may shall be made only from the State Risk Management
Trust Fund.

(2) Benefits provided under s. 112.1816(2) may not be paid from the fund
until each request for any out-of-pocket deductible, copayment, or

4
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Ch. 2021-113 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2021-113

coinsurance costs and one-time cash payout has been validated and
approved by the Department of Management Services.

Section 5. Section 284.45, Florida Statutes, is created to read:
284.45 Sexual harassment victims.—

1) An individual working for an entity covered by the State Risk
Management Trust Fund may not engage in retaliatory conduct of any kind
against a sexual harassment victim. As used in this section, the term “sexual
harassment victim” means an individual employed, or being considered for
employment, with an entity participating in the State Risk Management
Trust Fund who becomes a victim of workplace sexual harassment through
the course of employment, or while being considered for employment, with

the entity.
(2) The willful and knowing dissemination of personal identifying

information of a sexual harassment victim, which is confidential and exempt

pursuant to s. 119.071(2)(n), to any party other than a governmental entity

in furtherance of its official duties or pursuant to a court order is a
misdemeanor of the first degree, punishable as provided in s. 775.082.

Section 6. Subsections (1), (2), (3), (6), and (8) of section 497.101, Florida
Statutes, are amended to read:

497.101 Board of Funeral, Cemetery, and Consumer Services; member-
ship; appointment; terms.—

(1) The Board of Funeral, Cemetery, and Consumer Services is created
within the Department of Financial Services and shall consist of 10
members, 9 of whom shall be appointed by the Governor from nominations
made by the Chief Financial Officer and confirmed by the Senate. The Chief
Financial Officer shall nominate one to three persons for each of the nine
vacancies on the board, and the Governor shall fill each vacancy on the board
by appointing one of the three persons nominated by the Chief Financial
Officer to fill that vacancy. If the Governor objects to each of the three
nominations for a vacancy, she or he shall inform the Chief Financial Officer
in writing. Upon notification of an objection by the Governor, the Chief
Financial Officer shall submit one to three additional nominations for that
vacancy until the vacancy is filled. One member must be the State Health
Officer or her or his designee.

(2) Two members of the board must shall be funeral directors licensed
under part III of this chapter who are associated with a funeral establish-
ment. One member of the board must shall be a funeral director licensed
under part III of this chapter who is associated with a funeral establishment
licensed under part III of this chapter which that has a valid preneed license
issued pursuant to this chapter and who owns or operates a cinerator facility
approved under chapter 403 and licensed under part VI of this chapter. Two
members of the board must shall be persons whose primary occupation is

5
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2021-113 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2021-113

associated with a cemetery company licensed pursuant to this chapter. Two
Three members of the board must shall be consumers who are residents of
this the state, have never been licensed as funeral directors or embalmers,
are not connected with a cemetery or cemetery company licensed pursuant to
this chapter, and are not connected with the death care industry or the
practice of embalming, funeral directing, or direct disposition. One of the two
consumer members must sh&H be at least 60 years of age;-and-one-shall-be

. One member of
the board must be a consumer who is a resident of this state; is licensed as a
certified public accountant under chapter 473; has never been licensed as a
funeral director or an embalmer; is not a principal or an employee of any
licensee licensed under this chapter; and does not otherwise have control, as
defined in s. 497.005, over any licensee licensed under this chapter. One
member of the board must shall be a principal of a monument establishment
licensed under this chapter as a monument builder. One member must shall
be the State Health Officer or her or his designee. There may shall not be two
or more board members who are principals or employees of the same
company or partnership or group of companies or partnerships under
common control.

(3) Board members shall be appointed for terms of 4 years, and the State
Health Officer shall serve as long as that person holds that office. The
designee of the State Health Ofﬁcer shall serve at the pleasure of the

(6) The board shall maintain its headquarters and records ef the beard
shall be in the Division of Funeral, Cemetery, and Consumer Services of the
Department of Financial Services in the City of Tallahassee. The board may
be contacted through the Division of Funeral, Cemetery, and Consumer
Services of the Department of Financial Services in the City of Tallahassee.
The Chief Financial Officer shall annually appoint from among the board
members a chair and vice chair of the board. The board shall meet at least
every 6 months, and more often as necessary. Special meetings of the board
shall be convened upon the direction of the Chief Financial Officer. A
quorum is necessary for the conduct of business by the board. The
participation by a board member in a meeting conducted through commu-
nications media technology constitutes that individual’s presence at such
meeting. Board members appearing at a board meeting in person as well as
board members appearing through the use of communications media
technology shall be counted for the determination of a quorum. As used in
this subsection, “communications media technology” means the electronic
transmission of printed matter, audio, full-motion video, freeze-frame video,
compressed video, and digital video by any method available. Unless

6
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Ch. 2021-113 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2021-113

otherwise provided by law, six board members shall constitute a quorum for
the conduct of the board’s business.

Section 7. Subsections (2) through (5) of section 497.157, Florida
Statutes, are renumbered as subsections (4) through (7), respectively,
present subsection (3) is amended, and new subsections (2) and (3) and
subsection (8) are added to that section, to read:

497.157 Unlicensed practice; remedies concerning violations by unli-
censed persons.—

(2) A person may not be, act as, or advertise or hold himself or herself out

to be a funeral director, an embalmer, or a direct disposer unless he or she is
currently licensed by the department.

(3) A person may not be, act as, or advertise or hold himself or herself out

to be a preneed sales agent unless he or she is currently licensed by the

department and appointed by a preneed main licensee for which he or she is
executing preneed contracts.

(5)63) Where the department determines that an emergency exists
regarding any violation of this chapter by any unlicensed person or entity,
the department may issue and serve an immediate final order upon such
unlicensed person or entity, in accordance with s. 120.569(2)(n). Such an
immediate final order may impose such prohibitions and requirements as
are reasonably necessary to protect the public health, safety, and welfare,
and is shall be effective when served.

(a) For the purpose of enforcing such an immediate final order, the
department may file an emergency or other proceeding in the circuit courts
of the state seeking enforcement of the immediate final order by injunctive or
other order of the court. The court shall issue its injunction or other order
enforcing the immediate final order pending administrative resolution of the
matter under subsection (4) (2), unless the court determines that such action
would work a manifest injustice under the circumstances. Venue for judicial
actions under this paragraph must shall be, at the election of the
department, in the courts of Leon County; or in a county where the
respondent resides or has a place of business.

7
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2021-113 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2021-113

(b) After serving an immediate final order to cease and desist upon any
person or entity, the department shall within 10 days issue and serve upon
the same person or entity an administrative complaint as set forth in
subsection (4) (2), except that, absent order of a court to the contrary, the
immediate final order will shall be effective throughout the pendency of
proceedings under subsection (4) 2).

(8) Any person who is not licensed under this chapter and who engages in

activity requiring licensure under this chapter commits a felony of the third
degree, punishable as provided in s. 775.082, s. 775.083, or s. 775.084.

Section 8. Subsection (6) of section 497.159, Florida Statutes, is amended
to read:

497.159 Crimes.—

Section 9. Paragraphs (f) and (g) of subsection (1) of section 497.273,
Florida Statutes, are redesignated as paragraphs (e) and (f), respectively,
subsections (2), (3), and (4) are renumbered as subsections (3), (4), and (5),
respectively, paragraph (e) of subsection (1) is amended, and a new
subsection (2) is added to that section, to read:

497.273 Cemetery companies; authorized functions.—

(1) Within the boundaries of the cemetery lands it owns, a cemetery
company may perform the following functions:

(2) A cemetery company may perform the nonexclusive preneed and at-

need sale of monuments, memorials, markers, burial vaults, urns, flower
vases, floral arrangements, and other similar merchandise for use within a
cemetery, regardless of whether the cemetery is within the boundaries of the
cemetery lands the company owns.

Section 10. Paragraph (a) of subsection (4) of section 497.375, Florida
Statutes, is amended, paragraph (e) is added to subsection (4), and
paragraphs (b) and (c) of subsection (4) of that section are republished, to
read:

497.375 Funeral directing; licensure of a funeral director intern.—
(4)(a) A funeral director intern license expires 1 year after issuance and,

except as provided in paragraph (b), er-paragraph (c), or paragraph (e), may
not be renewed.

8
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2021-113 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2021-113

(b) A funeral director intern who is eligible for licensure under
subparagraph (1)(b)2. may renew her or his funeral director intern license
for an additional 1-year period if the funeral director in charge of the funeral
director intern training agency certifies to the licensing authority that the
intern has completed at least one-half of the course of study in mortuary
science or funeral service arts.

(¢) The licensing authority may adopt rules that allow a funeral director
intern to renew her or his funeral director intern license for an additional 1-
year period if the funeral director intern demonstrates her or his failure to
complete the internship before expiration of the license due to illness,
personal injury, or other substantial hardship beyond her or his reasonable
control or demonstrates that she or he has completed the requirements for
licensure as a funeral director but is awaiting the results of a licensure
examination. However, a funeral director intern who renews her or his
license under paragraph (b) is not eligible to renew the license under this
paragraph.

(e) Upon expiration of a funeral director intern license, any intern that
has completed the educational credentials required for a license as a funeral
director and has applied for licensure may continue to perform the tasks,
functions, and duties related to funeral directing in the manner provided in
paragraph (1)(d) until a license is issued or denied, or for a period of 90 days,
whichever occurs sooner.

Section 11. Paragraph (d) of subsection (2) of section 497.377, Florida
Statutes, is amended, and paragraph (c) of subsection (2) of that subsection
is republished, to read:

497.377 Combination funeral director and embalmer internships.—
(2)

(¢) A combination funeral director and embalmer intern may perform
only the tasks, functions, and duties relating to funeral directing and
embalming which are performed under the direct supervision of a licensed
funeral director who has an active, valid license under s. 497.373 or s.
497.374(1) and an embalmer who has an active, valid license under s.
497.368 or s. 497.369. However, a combination funeral director and
embalmer intern may perform such tasks, functions, and duties under the
general supervision of a licensed funeral director and embalmer upon
graduation from a college accredited by ABFSE with a degree as specified in
s. 497.373(1)(d) and upon passage of the examination required under s.
497.373(2)(b) if the funeral director in charge of the internship training
establishment, after 6 months of direct supervision, certifies to the licensing
authority that the intern is competent to complete the internship under
general supervision.

(d)1. A combination funeral director and embalmer intern license
expires 1 year after issuance and, except as provided in subparagraph 2.,

9
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2021-113 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2021-113

may not be renewed; however, upon expiration of a combination funeral
director and embalmer intern license, any intern that has completed the
educational credentials required for a combination license as both funeral
director and embalmer and has applied for licensure may continue to
perform the tasks, functions, and duties related to funeral directing and

embalming in the manner provided in paragraph (c) until a license is issued

or denied, or for a period of 90 days, whichever occurs sooner.

2. The licensing authority may adopt rules that allow a combination
funeral director and embalmer intern to renew her or his combination
funeral director and embalmer intern license for an additional 1 year if the
combination funeral director and embalmer intern demonstrates her or his
failure to complete the internship before expiration of the license due to
illness, personal injury, or other substantial hardship beyond her or his
reasonable control or demonstrates that she or he has completed the
requirements for licensure as a combination funeral director and embalmer
but is awaiting the results of a licensure examination.

Section 12. Paragraph (c) of subsection (1) of section 497.458, Florida
Statutes, is amended, and paragraph (a) of subsection (1) of that section is
republished, to read:

497.458 Disposition of proceeds received on contracts.—

(1)(a) Any person who is paid, collects, or receives funds under a preneed
contract for funeral services or merchandise or burial services or merchan-
dise shall deposit an amount at least equal to the sum of 70 percent of the
purchase price collected for all services sold and facilities rented; 100 percent
of the purchase price collected for all cash advance items sold; and 30 percent
of the purchase price collected or 110 percent of the wholesale cost,
whichever is greater, for each item of merchandise sold. The board may,
by rule, specify criteria for the classification of items sold in a preneed
contract as services, cash advances, or merchandise.

(c) Unless the preneed contract has been fulfilled, such deposits shall be
made within 30 days after the end of the calendar month in which payment
is received, under the terms of a revocable trust instrument entered into
with a trust company, with a national or state bank holding trust powers, or
with a federal or state savings and loan association holding trust powers.

Section 13. Paragraph (d) of subsection (1) of section 497.550, Florida
Statutes, is amended to read:

497.550 Licensure of monument establishments required; procedures
and criteria.—

(1) LICENSE REQUIRED.—No person shall conduct, maintain, man-
age, or operate a monument establishment in this state unless the
monument establishment is licensed pursuant to this part.

10
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2021-113 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2021-113

(d) The requirements of this chapter apply to both monument retailers
and monument builders, except as provided in this paragraph. Each
monument establishment shall be a physical structure that is located at a
specific street address, in compliance with zoning regulations of the
appropriate local government, and not located on property that is exempt
from taxation, but a monument retailer may not otherwise be required to
comply with s. 497.552(4) s-497.552-or be-subject-to-inspectionunder-this
chapter.

Section 14. Subsection (13) of section 552.081, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

552.081 Definitions.—As used in this chapter:

(13) “Two-component explosives” means any two inert components that
whieh, when mixed, become capable of detonation by a detonator aNe-—6
b}asﬁﬂgeap and shall be classified as a Class “A” explosive when so mixed.

Section 15. Subsection (2) of section 553.7921, Florida Statutes, is
renumbered as subsection (3), subsection (1) of that section is amended,
and a new subsection (2) is added to that section, to read:

553.7921 Fire alarm permit application to local enforcement agency.—

(1) A contractor must file a Uniform Fire Alarm Permit Application as
provided in subsection (3) €2) with the local enforcement agency and must
receive the fire alarm permit before:

(@) installing or replacing a fire alarm, if the local enforcement agency
requires a plan review for the installation or replacement;-or

(2) Ifthe local enforcement agency requires a fire alarm permit to repair

an existing alarm system that was previously permitted by the local
enforcement agency, a contractor may begin work after filing a Uniform
Fire Alarm Permit Application as provided in subsection (3). A fire alarm
repaired pursuant to this subsection may not be considered compliant until
the required permit is issued and the local enforcement agency approves the

repair.

Section 16. Effective January 1, 2022, subsection (3) and paragraph (i) of
subsection (7) of section 626.2815, Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

626.2815 Continuing education requirements.—

(3) Each licensee except a title insurance agent must complete a 4-hour
5-heur update course every 2 years which is specific to the license held by the
licensee. The course must be developed and offered by providers and

11
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2021-113 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2021-113

approved by the department. The content of the course must address all lines
of insurance for which examination and licensure are required and include
the following subject areas: insurance law updates, ethics for insurance
professionals, disciplinary trends and case studies, industry trends, pre-
mium discounts, determining suitability of products and services, and other
similar insurance-related topics the department determines are relevant to
legally and ethically carrying out the responsibilities of the license granted.
A licensee who holds multiple insurance licenses must complete an update
course that is specific to at least one of the licenses held. Except as otherwise
specified, any remaining required hours of continuing education are elective
and may consist of any continuing education course approved by the
department under this section.

(a) Except as provided in paragraphs (b), (c), (d), (e), (i), and (j), each
licensee must also complete 20 19 hours of elective continuing education
courses every 2 years.

(b) A licensee who has been licensed for 6 or more years must also
complete a minimum of 16 15 hours of elective continuing education every 2
years.

(¢) Alicensee who has been licensed for 25 years or more and is a CLU or
a CPCU or has a Bachelor of Science degree in risk management or
insurance with evidence of 18 or more semester hours in insurance-related
courses must also complete a minimum of 6 5 hours of elective continuing
education courses every 2 years.

(d) An individual who holds a license as a customer representative and
who is not a licensed life or health agent must also complete a minimum of 6
5 hours of continuing education courses every 2 years.

(e) Anindividual subject to chapter 648 must complete the 4-hour 5-heur
update course and a minimum of 10 9 hours of elective continuing education
courses every 2 years.

(f) Elective continuing education courses for public adjusters must be
specifically designed for public adjusters and approved by the department.
Notwithstanding this subsection, public adjusters for workers’ compensa-
tion insurance or health insurance are not required to take continuing
education courses pursuant to this section.

(g) Excess hours accumulated during any 2-year compliance period may
be carried forward to the next compliance period.

(h) Anindividual teaching an approved course of instruction or lecturing
at any approved seminar and attending the entire course or seminar
qualifies for the same number of classroom hours as would be granted to a
person taking and successfully completing such course or seminar. Credit is
limited to the number of hours actually taught unless a person attends the
entire course or seminar. An individual who is an official of or employed by a

12
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2021-113 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2021-113

governmental entity in this state and serves as a professor, instructor, or in
another position or office, the duties and responsibilities of which are
determined by the department to require monitoring and review of
insurance laws or insurance regulations and practices, is exempt from
this section.

(i) For compliance periods beginning on or after October 1, 2014, any
person who holds a license as a title insurance agent must complete a
minimum of 10 hours of continuing education credit every 2 years in title
insurance and escrow management specific to this state and approved by the
department, which must shall include at least 3 hours of continuing
education on the subject matter of ethics, rules, or compliance with state
and federal regulations relating specifically to title insurance and closing
services.

(j) For alicensee who is an active participant in an association, 2 hours of
elective continuing education credit per calendar year may be approved by
the department, if properly reported by the association.

(7) 'The following courses may be completed in order to meet the elective
continuing education course requirements:

(i) Any part of the Claims and Litigation Management Alliance (CLM)
Universal Claims Certification (UCC) professional designation: 20 19 hours
of elective continuing education and 4 5 hours of the continuing education
required under subsection (3).

Section 17. Subsections (1) and (2) of section 626.371, Florida Statutes,
are amended to read:

626.371 Payment of fees, taxes for appointment period without appoint-
ment.—

(1) All initial and renewal appointments shall be submitted to the
department on a monthly basis no later than 45 days after the date of
appointment and become effective on the date requested on the appointment
form.

(2)(@) If, upon application and qualification for an initial or renewal
appointment and such investigation as the department may make, it
appears—te the department determines that an individual has not been
properly appointed to represent an insurer or employer, that such individual
whe was formerly licensed or is currently licensed,

i i and that such individual
whe has been actively engaged or is currently actively engaged as such an
appointee, but-witheut-being appeinted-asrequired; the department shall
may, if it finds that such failure to be appointed was an inadvertent error on
the part of the insurer or employer so represented, notify the insurer or

employer of its finding and of the requirement to pay all fees and taxes due
pursuant to paragraph (b) within 21 days.

13
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Ch. 2021-113 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2021-113

(b) The department may nevertheless issue or authorize the issuance of
the appointment upon the insurer’s or employer’s timely payment to the
department of as-applied-for-but-subjeet-to-the-eonditionthat, before-the
appeointment-is-issued; all fees and taxes that whieh would have been due
had the applicant been properly se appointed during such current and prior
periods, including with-applieable fees and taxes that would have been due
pursuant to s. 624.501 for such current and prior periods of appointment;

shall-be-paid-to-the-department.
(¢) Upon proper appointment of the individual and payment of all fees
and taxes due pursuant to paragraph (b), paragraph (3)(a), and s. 624.501 by

the insurer or employer, the department may no longer consider the
inadvertent failure to appoint to be a violation of this code.

(d) If the insurer or employer does not pay the fees and taxes due
pursuant to paragraph (b) within 21 days after notice by the department, the
department shall suspend the insurer’s or employer’s authority to appoint

licensees until all outstanding fees and taxes have been paid.

Section 18. Subsection (3) of section 626.7351, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

626.7351 Qualifications for customer representative’s license.—The
department shall not grant or issue a license as customer representative
to any individual found by it to be untrustworthy or incompetent, or who
does not meet each of the following qualifications:

(8) Within 4 years preceding the date that the application for license was
filed with the department, the applicant has earned the designation of
Accredited Advisor in Insurance (AAI), Associate in General Insurance
(AINS), or Accredited Customer Service Representative (ACSR) from the
Insurance Institute of America; the designation of Certified Insurance
Counselor (CIC) from the Society of Certified Insurance Service Counselors;
the designation of Certified Professional Service Representative (CPSR)
from the National Foundation for CPSR; the designation of Certified
Insurance Service Representative (CISR) from the Society of Certified
Insurance Service Representatives; the designation of Certified Insurance
Representative (CIR) from All-Lines Training; the designation of Profes-
sional Customer Service Representative (PCSR) from the Professional
Career Institute; the designation of Insurance Customer Service Represen-
tative (ICSR) from Statewide Insurance Associates LLC; the designation of
Registered Customer Service Representative (RCSR) from a regionally
accredited postsecondary institution in the state whose curriculum is
approved by the department and includes comprehensive analysis of basic
property and casualty lines of insurance and testing which demonstrates
mastery of the subject; or a degree from an accredited institution of higher
learning approved by the department when the degree includes a minimum
of 9 credit hours of insurance instruction, including specific instruction in
the areas of property, casualty, and inland marine insurance. The

14
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Ch. 2021-113 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2021-113

department shall adopt rules establishing standards for the approval of
curriculum.

Section 19. Subsection (1) of section 626.8443, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

626.8443 Duration of suspension or revocation.—

(1) The department shall, in its order suspending a title insurance
agent’s or agency’s license or appointment or in its order suspending the
eligibility of a person to hold or apply for such license or appointment, specify
the period during which the suspension is to be in effect, but such period may
shall not exceed 2 years 1year. The license, er appointment, or eligibility will
shall remain suspended during the period so specified, subject, however, to
any rescission or modification of the order by the department, or modifica-
tion or reversal thereof by the court, prior to expiration of the suspension
period. A license, appointment, or eligibility that whieh has been suspended
may not be reinstated except upon request for such reinstatement, but the
department may shall not grant such reinstatement if it finds that the
circumstance or circumstances for which the license, appointment, and
eligibility was suspended still exist or are likely to recur.

Section 20. Paragraph (e) of subsection (1) and paragraph (b) of
subsection (3) of section 626.916, Florida Statutes, are amended, and
paragraphs (a) through (d) of subsection (1) of that section are republished,
to read:

626.916 Eligibility for export.—

(1) No insurance coverage shall be eligible for export unless it meets all
of the following conditions:

(a) The full amount of insurance required must not be procurable, after a
diligent effort has been made by the producing agent to do so, from among
the insurers authorized to transact and actually writing that kind and class
of insurance in this state, and the amount of insurance exported shall be only
the excess over the amount so procurable from authorized insurers. Surplus
lines agents must verify that a diligent effort has been made by requiring a
properly documented statement of diligent effort from the retail or producing
agent. However, to be in compliance with the diligent effort requirement, the
surplus lines agent’s reliance must be reasonable under the particular
circumstances surrounding the export of that particular risk. Reason-
ableness shall be assessed by taking into account factors which include,
but are not limited to, a regularly conducted program of verification of the
information provided by the retail or producing agent. Declinations must be
documented on a risk-by-risk basis. If it is not possible to obtain the full
amount of insurance required by layering the risk, it is permissible to export
the full amount.

15
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2021-113 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2021-113

(b) The premium rate at which the coverage is exported shall not be
lower than that rate applicable, if any, in actual and current use by a
majority of the authorized insurers for the same coverage on a similar risk.

(c) The policy or contract form under which the insurance is exported
shall not be more favorable to the insured as to the coverage or rate than
under similar contracts on file and in actual current use in this state by the
majority of authorized insurers actually writing similar coverages on similar
risks; except that a coverage may be exported under a unique form of policy
designed for use with respect to a particular subject of insurance if a copy of
such form is filed with the office by the surplus lines agent desiring to use the
same and is subject to the disapproval of the office within 10 days of filing
such form exclusive of Saturdays, Sundays, and legal holidays if it finds that
the use of such special form is not reasonably necessary for the principal
purposes of the coverage or that its use would be contrary to the purposes of
this Surplus Lines Law with respect to the reasonable protection of
authorized insurers from unwarranted competition by unauthorized in-
surers.

(d) Except as to extended coverage in connection with fire insurance
policies and except as to windstorm insurance, the policy or contract under
which the insurance is exported shall not provide for deductible amounts, in
determining the existence or extent of the insurer’s liability, other than
those available under similar policies or contracts in actual and current use
by one or more authorized insurers.

(b) Subsection (1) does Paragraphs{(b{a)-(d)-de not apply to classes of

insurance which are related to indemnity of deductibles for property
insurance or are subject to s. 627.062(3)(d)1. These classes may be
exportable under the following conditions:

1. The insurance must be placed only by or through a surplus lines agent
licensed in this state;

2. The insurer must be made eligible under s. 626.918; and

16
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2021-113 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2021-113

3. The insured must sign a disclosure that substantially provides the
following: “You are agreeing to place coverage in the surplus lines market.
Superior coverage may be available in the admitted market and at a lesser
cost. Persons insured by surplus lines carriers are not protected under the
Florida Insurance Guaranty Act with respect to any right of recovery for the
obligation of an insolvent unlicensed insurer.” If the notice is signed by the
insured, the insured is presumed to have been informed and to know that
other coverage may be available, and, with respect to the diligent-effort
requirement under subsection (1), there is no liability on the part of, and no
cause of action arises against, the retail agent presenting the form.

Section 21. Paragraph (e) is added to subsection (1) of section 626.9551,
Florida Statutes, to read:

626.9551 Favored agent or insurer; coercion of debtors.—
(1) No person may:

(e) Require an insurance agent or agency to directly or indirectly provide
the replacement cost estimator or other underwriting information of an
insurer underwriting an insurance policy covering real property, as a
condition precedent or condition subsequent to the lending of money or
extension of credit to be secured by real property, when such information is
the proprietary business information of an insurer, as defined in s.
624.4212(1), nor may an agent or agency provide this information.

Section 22. Subsections (4) through (10) of section 627.715, Florida
Statutes, are renumbered as subsections (5) through (11), respectively, and a
new subsection (4) is added to that section, to read:

627.715 Flood insurance.—An authorized insurer may issue an insur-
ance policy, contract, or endorsement providing personal lines residential
coverage for the peril of flood or excess coverage for the peril of flood on any
structure or the contents of personal property contained therein, subject to
this section. This section does not apply to commercial lines residential or
commercial lines nonresidential coverage for the peril of flood. An insurer
may issue flood insurance policies, contracts, endorsements, or excess
coverage on a standard, preferred, customized, flexible, or supplemental
basis.

(4) An agent may export a contract or an endorsement providing flood

coverage to an eligible surplus lines insurer without making a diligent effort
to seek such coverage from three or more authorized insurers under s.

626.916(1)(a).

Section 23. Subsection (3) of section 633.102, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

633.102 Definitions.—As used in this chapter, the term:

17
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2021-113 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2021-113

(8)a) “Contractor I” means a contractor whose business includes the
execution of contracts requiring the ability to lay out, fabricate, install,
inspect, alter, repair, and service all types of fire protection systems,
excluding preengineered systems.

(b) “Contractor II” means a contractor whose business is limited to the
execution of contracts requiring the ability to lay out, fabricate, install,
inspect, alter, repair, and service water sprinkler systems, water spray
systems, foam-water sprinkler systems, foam-water spray systems, stand-
pipes, combination standpipes and sprinkler risers, all piping that is an
integral part of the system beginning at the point of service as defined in this
section, sprinkler tank heaters, air lines, thermal systems used in connec-
tion with sprinklers, and tanks and pumps connected thereto, excluding
preengineered systems.

(c) “Contractor III” means a contractor whose business is limited to the
execution of contracts requiring the ability to fabricate, install, inspect,
alter, repair, and service carbon dioxide systems, foam extinguishing
systems, dry chemical systems, and Halon and other chemical systems,
excluding preengineered systems.

(d) “Contractor IV” means a contractor whose business is limited to the
execution of contracts requiring the ability to lay out, fabricate, install,
inspect, alter, repair, and service automatic fire sprinkler systems for
detached one-family dwellings, detached two-family dwellings, and mobile
homes, excluding preengineered systems and excluding single-family homes
in cluster units, such as apartments, condominiums, and assisted living
facilities or any building that is connected to other dwellings. A Contractor
IV is limited to the scope of practice specified in NFPA 13D.

(e) “Contractor V’ means a contractor whose business is limited to the
execution of contracts requiring the ability to fabricate, install, inspect,
alter, repair, and service the underground piping for a fire protection system
using water as the extinguishing agent beginning at the point of service as
defined in this act and ending no more than 1 foot above the finished floor.

The-definitionsin This subsection may not be construed to include engineers
or architects within the defined terms and does de not limit or prohibit a
licensed fire protection engineer or architect with fire protection design
experience from designing any type of fire protection system. A distinction is
made between system design concepts prepared by the design professional
and system layout as defined in this section and typically prepared by the
contractor. However, a person certified as a Contractor I or; Contractor II;-er

may design new fire protection systems of
49 or fewer sprinklers;;—and may design the alteration of an existing fire
sprinkler system if the alteration consists of the relocation, addition, or
deletion of net-mere than 49 or fewer sprinklers, notwithstanding the size of
the existing fire sprinkler system; or may design the alteration of an existing
fire sprinkler system if the alteration consists of the relocation or deletion of

249 or fewer sprinklers, notwithstanding the size of the existing fire

18
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Ch. 2021-113 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2021-113

sprinkler system, if there is no change of occupancy, as defined in the Florida
Building Code and the Florida Fire Prevention Code, of the affected areas

and there is no change in the water demand as defined in NFPA 13,
“Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems,” and if the occupancy

hazard classification as defined in NFPA 13 is reduced or remains the same
as a result of the alteration. Conflicts between the Florida Building Code and
the Florida Fire Prevention Code shall be resolved pursuant to s.
553.73(1)(d). A person certified as a Contractor I, Contractor II, or
Contractor IV may design or alter a fire protection system, the scope of
which complies with NFPA 13D, “Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler
Systems in One- and Two- Famlly Dwellings and Manufactured Homes,” as
adopted by the State Fire Marshal, notwithstanding the number of fire
sprinklers. Contractor-developed plans may not be required by any local
permitting authority to be sealed by a registered professional engineer.

Section 24. Section 633.136, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

633.136 Fire and Emergency Incident Information Reporting Program,;
duties; fire reports.—

(1)(a) The Fire and Emergency Incident Information Reporting Program
is created within the division. The program shall:

1. Establish and maintain an electronic communication system capable
of transmitting fire and emergency incident information to and between fire

service providers preteetion-ageneies.

2. Initiate a Fire and Emergency Incident Information Reporting System
that is shall be responsible for:

a. Receiving fire and emergency incident information from fire service

providers pretection-ageneies.

b. Preparing and disseminating annual reports to the Governor, the
President of the Senate, the Speaker of the House of Representatives, fire
service providers preteetion—ageneies, and, upon request, the public. Each
report must shall include, but not be limited to, the information listed in the
National Fire Incident Reporting System.

c. Upon request, providing other states and federal agencies with fire
and emergency incident data of this state.

3. Adopt rules to effectively and efficiently implement, administer,
manage, maintain, and use the Fire and Emergency Incident Information
Reporting Program. The rules shall be considered minimum requirements
and may shall not preclude a fire service provider protection-ageney from
implementing its own requirements that whiech may not conflict with the
rules of the division.

19
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2021-113 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2021-113

4. By rule, establish procedures and a format for each fire service
provider proteetion-ageney to voluntarily monitor its records and submit
reports to the program.

5. Maintain Establish an electronic information database that is
accessible and searchable by fire service providers pretection-ageneies.

(b) The division shall consult with the Florida Forest Service of the
Department of Agriculture and Consumer Services and the State Surgeon
General of the Department of Health to coordinate data, ensure accuracy of
the data, and limit duplication of efforts in data collection, analysis, and
reporting.

(2) The Fire and Emergency Incident Information System Technical
Advisory Panel is created within the division. The panel shall advise, review,
and recommend to the State Fire Marshal with respect to the requirements
of this section. The membership of the panel consists shall-eensist of the

foellewing 15 members:

ta)—The-eurrent-13-members of the Firefighters Employment, Standards,
and Training Council as established in s. 633.402.

(3) As used in F—er—the—puiﬁpese—ef this section, the term “fire service

provider” has the same meaning as in s. 633.102 ﬁﬁreﬂafeteet}en—ageﬁeyﬂ
shall be defined by rule by the division.

Section 25. Subsection (18) of section 633.202, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

633.202 Florida Fire Prevention Code.—

(18) The authority having jurisdiction shall determine the minimum
radio signal strength for fire department communications in all new high-
rise and existing high-rise buildings. Existing buildings are not required to
comply with minimum radio strength for fire department communications
and two-way radio system enhancement communications as required by the
Florida Fire Prevention Code until January 1, 2025 2022. However, by
January 1, 2024 Deeember31,2019, an existing building that is not in
compliance with the requirements for minimum radio strength for fire
department communications must apply for an appropriate permit for the
required installation with the local government agency having jurisdiction
and must demonstrate that the building will become compliant by January
1, 2025 2022. Existing apartment buildings are not required to comply until
January 1, 2025. However, existing apartment buildings are required to

20
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Ch. 2021-113 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2021-113

apply for the appropriate permit for the required communications installa-
tion by January 1, 2024 Deeember-31,-2022.

Section 26. Section 633.217, Florida Statutes, is created to read:

633.217 Influencing a firesafety inspector; prohibited acts.—

(1) A person may not influence a firesafety inspector by:

(a) Threatening, coercing, tricking, or attempting to threaten, coerce, or

trick the firesafety inspector into violating any provision of the Florida Fire

Prevention Code, any rule adopted by the State Fire Marshal, or any
provision of this chapter.

(b) Offering any compensation to the firesafety inspector to induce a
violation of the Florida Fire Prevention Code, any rule adopted by the State

Fire Marshal, or any provision of this chapter.

(2) A firesafety inspector may not knowingly and intentionally request,
solicit, accept, or agree to accept compensation offered as described in
paragraph (1)(b).

Section 27. Paragraphs (d), (g), and (h) of subsection (4) of section
633.304, Florida Statutes, are amended to read:

633.304 Fire suppression equipment; license to install or maintain.—
(4)

(d) A license of any class may not be issued or renewed by the division
and a license of any class does not remain operative unless:

1. The applicant has submitted to the State Fire Marshal evidence of
registration as a Florida corporation or evidence of compliance with s.
865.09.

2. The State Fire Marshal or his or her designee has by inspection
determined that the applicant possesses the equipment required for the
class of license sought. The State Fire Marshal shall give an applicant a
reasonable opportunity to correct any deficiencies discovered by inspection.
To obtain such inspection, an applicant with facilities located outside this
state must:

a. Provide a notarized statement from a professional engineer licensed
by the applicant’s state of domicile certifying that the applicant possesses
the equipment required for the class of license sought and that all such
equipment is operable; or

b. Allow the State Fire Marshal or her or his designee to inspect the
facility. All costs associated with the State Fire Marshal’s inspection must be
paid by the applicant. The State Fire Marshal, in accordance with s. 120.54,
may adopt rules to establish standards for the calculation and establishment

21
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2021-113 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2021-113

of the amount of costs associated with any inspection conducted by the State
Fire Marshal under this section. Such rules must include procedures for
invoicing and receiving funds in advance of the inspection.

3. The applicant has submitted to the State Fire Marshal proof of
insurance providing coverage for comprehensive general liability for bodily
injury and property damage, products liability, completed operations, and
contractual liability. The State Fire Marshal shall adopt rules providing for
the amounts of such coverage, but such amounts may not be less than
$300,000 for Class A or Class D licenses, $200,000 for Class B licenses, and
$100,000 for Class C licenses; and the total coverage for any class of license
held in conjunction with a Class D license may not be less than $300,000.
The State Fire Marshal may, at any time after the issuance of a license or its
renewal, require upon demand, and in no event more than 30 days after
notice of such demand, the licensee to provide proof of insurance, on the
insurer’s form, containing confirmation of insurance coverage as required by
this chapter. Failure, for any length of time, to provide proof of insurance
coverage as required must result in the immediate suspension of the license
until proof of proper insurance is provided to the State Fire Marshal. An
insurer that provides such coverage shall notify the State Fire Marshal of
any change in coverage or of any termination, cancellation, or nonrenewal of
any coverage.

4. The applicant applies to the State Fire Marshal, provides proof of
experience, and successfully completes a prescribed training course that
includes both written and practical training effered by the State Fire Gollege

approved by the State Fire Marshal as applicable to
the class of license being sought. This subparagraph does not apply to any
holder of or applicant for a permit under paragraph (g) or to a business
organization or a governmental entity seeking initial licensure or renewal of
an existing license solely for the purpose of inspecting, servicing, repairing,
marking, recharging, and maintaining fire extinguishers used and located
on the premises of and owned by such organization or entity.

5. The applicant has a current retestor identification number that is
appropriate for the license for which the applicant is applying and that is
listed with the United States Department of Transportation.

6. The applicant has passed, with a grade of at least 70 percent, a written
examination testing his or her knowledge of the rules and statutes governing
the activities authorized by the license and demonstrating his or her
knowledge and ability to perform those tasks in a competent, lawful, and
safe manner. Such examination must be developed and administered by the
State Fire Marshal, or his or her designee in accordance with policies and
procedures of the State Fire Marshal. An applicant shall pay a nonrefund-
able examination fee of $50 for each examination or reexamination
scheduled. A reexamination may not be scheduled sooner than 30 days
after any administration of an examination to an applicant. An applicant
may not be permitted to take an examination for any level of license more
than a total of four times during 1 year, regardless of the number of

22
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2021-113 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2021-113

applications submitted. As a prerequisite to licensure of the applicant, he or
she:

a. Must be at least 18 years of age.

b. Must have 4 years of proven experience as a fire equipment permittee
at a level equal to or greater than the level of license applied for or have a
combination of education and experience determined to be equivalent
thereto by the State Fire Marshal. Having held a permit at the appropriate
level for the required period constitutes the required experience.

c¢. Must not have been convicted of a felony or a crime punishable by
imprisonment of 1 year or more under the law of the United States or of any
state thereof or under the law of any other country. “Convicted” means a
finding of guilt or the acceptance of a plea of guilty or nolo contendere in any
federal or state court or a court in any other country, without regard to
whether a judgment of conviction has been entered by the court having
jurisdiction of the case. If an applicant has been convicted of any such felony,
the applicant is excluded from licensure for a period of 4 years after
expiration of sentence or final release by the Florida Commission on
Offender Review unless the applicant, before the expiration of the 4-year
period, has received a full pardon or has had her or his civil rights restored.

This subparagraph does not apply to any holder of or applicant for a permit
under paragraph (g) or to a business organization or a governmental entity
seeking initial licensure or renewal of an existing license solely for the
purpose of inspecting, servicing, repairing, marking, recharging, hydrotest-
ing, and maintaining fire extinguishers used and located on the premises of
and owned by such organization or entity.

(g) A permit of any class may not be issued or renewed to a person by the
division, and a permit of any class does not remain operative, unless the
person has:

1. Submitted a nonrefundable examination fee in the amount of $50.

2. Successfully completed a training course that includes both written
and practical training i i
eourse approved by the State Fire Marshal as applicable to the class of
license being sought.

3. Passed, with a grade of at least 70 percent, a written examination
testing his or her knowledge of the rules and statutes governing the
activities authorized by the permit and demonstrating his or her knowledge
and ability to perform those tasks in a competent, lawful, and safe manner.
Such examination must be developed and administered by the State Fire
Marshal in accordance with the policies and procedures of the State Fire
Marshal. An examination fee must be paid for each examination scheduled.
A reexamination may not be scheduled sooner than 30 days after any
administration of an examination to an applicant. An applicant may not be

23
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2021-113 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2021-113

permitted to take an examination for any level of permit more than four
times during 1 year, regardless of the number of applications submitted. As
a prerequisite to taking the permit examination, the applicant must be at
least 16 years of age.

(h) An applicant for a license or permit under this section who fails the
examination may take it three more times during the 1-year period after he
or she originally filed an application for the examination. If the applicant
fails the examination within 1 year after the application date and he or she
seeks to retake the examination, he or she must file a new application, pay
the application and examination fees, and successfully complete a prescribed
training course that includes both written and practical training effered by

i i approved by the State Fire
Marshal as applicable to the class of license being sought. The applicant may
not submit a new application within 6 months after the date of his or her
fourth reexamination. An applicant who passes the examination but does
not meet the remaining qualifications prescribed by law and rule within 1
year after the application date must file a new application, pay the
application and examination fee, successfully complete a prescribed training
course that includes both written and practical training
i i approved by the State Fire
Marshal as applicable to the class of license being sought, and pass the
written examination.

Section 28. Subsection (1) of section 633.402, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

633.402 Firefighters Employment, Standards, and Training Council;
organization; meetings; quorum; compensation; seal; special powers; fire-
fighter training.—

(1) There is created within the department a Firefighters Employment,
Standards, and Training Council of 15 34 members.

(a) The members shall be appointed as follows:
1. Two fire chiefs appointed by the Florida Fire Chiefs Association.

2. Two firefighters, who are not officers, appointed by the Florida
Professional Firefighters Association.

3. Two firefighter officers, who are not fire chiefs, appointed by the State
Fire Marshal.

4. One individual appointed by the Florida League of Cities.
5. One individual appointed by the Florida Association of Counties.

6. One individual appointed by the Florida Association of Special
Districts.

24
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2021-113 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2021-113

7. One individual appointed by the Florida Fire Marshals’ and Inspec-
tors’ Association.

8. One employee of the Florida Forest Service of the Department of
Agriculture and Consumer Services appointed by the director of the Florida
Forest Service.

9. One individual appointed by the State Fire Marshal.

10. One director or instructor of a state-certified firefighting training
facility appointed by the State Fire Marshal.

11. One individual The remaining-member,-who-shall-be appointed by

the State Fire Marshal, who may not be a member or representative of the
firefighting profession or of any local government.

12. One individual from the Department of Health, appointed by the
Surgeon General.

(b) To be eligible for appointment as a member under subparagraph (a)
1., subparagraph (a)2., subparagraph (a)3., subparagraph (a)8., or subpar-
agraph (a)10., a person must have had at least 4 years’ experience in the
firefighting profession. Members shall serve only as long as they continue to
meet the criteria under which they were appointed, or unless a member has
failed to appear at three consecutive and properly noticed meetings unless
excused by the chair.

Section 29. Subsection (1) of section 633.416, Florida Statutes, is
amended to read:

633.416 Firefighter employment and volunteer firefighter service; sav-
ing clause.—

(1) A fire service provider may not employ an individual to:

(a) Extinguish fires for the protection of life or property or to supervise
individuals who perform such services unless the individual holds a current
and valid Firefighter Certificate of Compliance. However, a person who is
currently serving as a volunteer firefighter and holds a volunteer firefighter
certificate of completion with a fire service provider, who is then employed as

a regular or permanent firefighter by such fire service provider, may
function, for a period of 1 year under the direct supervision of an individual

holding a valid Firefighter Certificate of Compliance, in the same capacity in
which he or she acted as a volunteer firefighter, provided that he or she has

completed all training required by the volunteer organization. Under no
circumstance can this period extend beyond 1 year either collectively or

consecutively from the start of employment to obtain a Firefighter
Certificate of Compliance; or

(b) Serve as the administrative and command head of a fire service
provider for a period in excess of 1 year unless the individual holds a current

25
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2021-113 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2021-113

and valid Firefighter Certificate of Compliance or Special Certificate of
Compliance.

Section 30. Section 648.30, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

648.30 Licensure and appointment required; prohibited acts; penalties.

(1) A person may not act in the capacity of a bail bond agent or temporary
bail bond agent or perform any of the functions, duties, or powers prescribed
for bail bond agents or temporary bail bond agents under this chapter unless
that person is qualified, licensed, and appointed as provided in this chapter.

(2) A person may not represent himself or herself to be a bail
enforcement agent, bounty hunter, or other similar title in this state.

(3) A person, other than a certified law enforcement officer, may not
apprehend, detain, or arrest a principal on a bond, wherever issued, unless
that person is qualified, licensed, and appointed as provided in this chapter
or licensed as a bail bond agent or bail bond enforcement agent, or holds an
equivalent license by the state where the bond was written.

(4) Any person who violates this section commits a felony of the third
degree, punishable as provided in s. 775.082, s. 775.083, or s. 775.084.

(56) Any licensee under this chapter who knowingly aids or abets an

unlicensed person in violating this section commits a felony of the third
degree, punishable as provided in s. 775.082, s. 775.083, or s. 775.084.

Section 31. Section 843.08, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

843.08 False personation.—A person who falsely assumes or pretends to
be a firefighter, a sheriff, an officer of the Florida Highway Patrol, an officer
of the Fish and Wildlife Conservation Commission, an officer of the
Department of Environmental Protection, a—fire—er-arsen—investigator—of
the Department—of Finaneial -Serviees; an officer of the Department of
Financial Services, any personnel or representative of the Division of
Investigative and Forensic Services, an officer of the Department of
Corrections, a correctional probation officer, a deputy sheriff, a state
attorney or an assistant state attorney, a statewide prosecutor or an
assistant statewide prosecutor, a state attorney investigator, a coroner, a
police officer, a lottery special agent or lottery investigator, a beverage
enforcement agent, a school guardian as described in s. 30.15(1)(k), a
security officer licensed under chapter 493, any member of the Florida
Commission on Offender Review or any administrative aide or supervisor
employed by the commission, any personnel or representative of the
Department of Law Enforcement, or a federal law enforcement officer as
defined in s. 901.1505, and takes upon himself or herself to act as such, or to
require any other person to aid or assist him or her in a matter pertaining to
the duty of any such officer, commits a felony of the third degree, punishable
as provided in s. 775.082, s. 775.083, or s. 775.084. However, a person who
falsely personates any such officer during the course of the commission of a

26
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Ch. 2021-113 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2021-113

felony commits a felony of the second degree, punishable as provided in s.
775.082, s. 775.083, or s. 775.084. If the commission of the felony results in
the death or personal injury of another human being, the person commits a
felony of the first degree, punishable as provided in s. 775.082, s. 775.083, or
s. 775.084.

Section 32. Paragraph (f) is added to subsection (11) of section 943.045,
Florida Statutes, to read:

943.045 Definitions; ss. 943.045-943.08.—The following words and
phrases as used in ss. 943.045-943.08 shall have the following meanings:

(11) “Criminal justice agency” means:

(f) The investigations component of the Department of Financial
Services which investigates the crimes of fraud and official misconduct in
all public assistance given to residents of this state or provided to others by
this state.

Section 33. Except as otherwise expressly provided in this act, this act
shall take effect July 1, 2021.

Approved by the Governor June 16, 2021.
Filed in Office Secretary of State June 16, 2021.

27
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



