CHAPTER 2024-191

Committee Substitute for Committee Substitute for
Committee Substitute for House Bill No. 267

An act relating to building regulations; amending s. 468.609, F.S.; revising
the eligibility requirements a person must meet to take an examination for
certification as a building code inspector or plans examiner; amending s.
553.73, F.S.; requiring the Florida Building Commission to modify
provisions in the Florida Building Code relating to sealed drawings by
a design professional for replacement windows, doors, or garage doors on
certain dwellings or townhouses; providing requirements for such
modifications; amending s. 553.79, F.S.; removing provisions relating to
acquiring building permits for certain residential dwellings; amending s.
553.791, F.S.; defining the term “private provider firm”; amending
provisions requiring private providers to provide specified notice to the
local building official; revising the timeframes in which local building
officials must issue permits or provide certain written notice if certain
private providers affix their professional seal to an affidavit; providing
requirements for such written notices; deeming a permit application
approved under certain circumstances; prohibiting a local building code
enforcement agency from auditing the performance of private providers
until the local building code enforcement agency creates standard
operating private provider audit procedures; providing requirements for
such audit procedures; requiring the audit procedures to be publicly
available online and printed; requiring printed audit procedures to be
available in the agency’s buildings; requiring that private provider audit
results of staff for a specified timeframe be made publicly available;
requiring the agency’s audit processes to adhere to the agency’s standard
operating audit procedures; revising how often a private provider or
private provider firm may be audited; requiring certain written commu-
nication be provided to the private provider or private provider firm under
certain circumstances; conforming cross-references; conforming provi-
sions to changes made by the act; amending s. 553.792, F.S.; revising the
timeframes for approving, approving with conditions, or denying certain
building permits; prohibiting a local government from requiring a waiver
of certain timeframes; requiring local governments to meet the prescribed
timeframes unless a local ordinance is more stringent; requiring a local
government to provide written notice to an applicant under certain
circumstances; requiring a local government to reduce permit fees by a
certain percentage if certain deadlines are not met; providing exceptions;
specifying requirements for the written notice to the permit applicant;
specifying a timeframe for the applicant to correct the application;
specifying a timeframe for the local government and local enforcement
agency to approve or deny certain building permits following revision;
requiring a reduction in the building permit fee if the approval deadline is
not met; providing an exception; amending s. 553.80, F.S.; authorizing
local governments to use certain fees for certain technology upgrades;

1
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2024-191 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2024-191

creating s. 553.9065, F.S.; providing that certain unvented attic and
unvented enclosed rafter assemblies meet the requirements of the Florida
Building Code, Energy Conservation; requiring the commission to review
and consider certain provisions of law and technical amendments thereto
and report its findings to the Legislature by a specified date; amending s.
440.103, F.S.; conforming a cross-reference; providing effective dates.

Be It Enacted by the Legislature of the State of Florida:

Section 1. Paragraph (c) of subsection (2) of section 468.609, Florida
Statutes, is amended to read:

468.609 Administration of this part; standards for certification; addi-
tional categories of certification.—

(2) A person may take the examination for certification as a building code
inspector or plans examiner pursuant to this part if the person:

(c) Meets eligibility requirements according to one of the following
criteria:

1. Demonstrates 4 years’ combined experience in the field of construction
or a related field, building code inspection, or plans review corresponding to
the certification category sought;

2. Demonstrates a combination of postsecondary education in the field of
construction or a related field and experience which totals 3 years, with at
least 1 year of such total being experience in construction, building code
inspection, or plans review;

3. Demonstrates a combination of technical education in the field of
construction or a related field and experience which totals 3 years, with at
least 1 year of such total being experience in construction, building code
inspection, or plans review;

4. Currently holds a standard certificate issued by the board or a
firesafety inspector license issued under chapter 633, with a minimum of 3
years’ verifiable full-time experience in firesafety inspection or firesafety
plan review, and has satisfactorily completed a building code inspector or
plans examiner training program that provides at least 100 hours but not
more than 200 hours of cross-training in the certification category sought.
The board shall establish by rule criteria for the development and
implementation of the training programs. The board must accept all
classroom training offered by an approved provider if the content substan-
tially meets the intent of the classroom component of the training program,;

5. Demonstrates a combination of the completion of an approved training
program in the field of building code inspection or plan review and a
minimum of 2 years’ experience in the field of building code inspection, plan
review, fire code inspections and fire plans review of new buildings as a

2
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2024-191 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2024-191

firesafety inspector certified under s. 633.216, or construction. The approved
training portion of this requirement must include proof of satisfactory
completion of a training program that provides at least 200 hours but not
more than 300 hours of cross-training that is approved by the board in the
chosen category of building code inspection or plan review in the certification
category sought with at least 20 hours but not more than 30 hours of
instruction in state laws, rules, and ethics relating to professional standards
of practice, duties, and responsibilities of a certificateholder. The board shall
coordinate with the Building Officials Association of Florida, Inc., to
establish by rule the development and implementation of the training
program. However, the board must accept all classroom training offered by
an approved provider if the content substantially meets the intent of the
classroom component of the training program;

6. Currently holds a standard certificate issued by the board or a
firesafety inspector license issued under chapter 633 and:

a. Has at least 4 years’ verifiable full-time experience as an inspector or
plans examiner in a standard certification category currently held or has a
minimum of 4 years’ verifiable full-time experience as a firesafety inspector
licensed under chapter 633.

b. Has satisfactorily completed a building code inspector or plans
examiner classroom training course or program that provides at least 200
but not more than 300 hours in the certification category sought, except for
residential training programs, which must provide at least 500 but not more
than 800 hours of training as prescribed by the board. The board shall
establish by rule criteria for the development and implementation of
classroom training courses and programs in each certification category; or

7.a. Has completed a 4-year internship certification program as a
building code inspector or plans examiner, including an internship program
for residential inspectors, while also employed full-time by a municipality,
county, or other governmental jurisdiction, under the direct supervision of a
certified building official. A person may also complete the internship
certification program, including an internship program for residential
inspectors, while employed full time by a private provider or a private
provider’s firm that performs the services of a building code inspector or
plans examiner, while under the direct supervision of a certified building
official. Proof of graduation with a related vocational degree or college degree
or of verifiable work experience may be exchanged for the internship
experience requirement year-for-year, but may reduce the requirement to no
less than 1 year.

b. Has passed an examination administered by the International Code
Council in the certification category sought. Such examination must be
passed before beginning the internship certification program.

c. Has passed the principles and practice examination before completing
the internship certification program.

3
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2024-191 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2024-191

d. Has passed a board-approved 40-hour code training course in the
certification category sought before completing the internship certification
program.

e. Has obtained a favorable recommendation from the supervising
building official after completion of the internship certification program.

Section 2. Paragraph (g) is added to subsection (7) of section 553.73,
Florida Statutes, to read:

553.73 Florida Building Code.—
(7)

(g) The commission shall modify the Florida Building Code to state that
sealed drawings by a design professional are not required for the replace-
ment of windows, doors, or garage doors in an existing one-family or two-
family dwelling or townhouse if all of the following conditions are met:

1. The replacement windows, doors, or garage doors are installed in

accordance with the manufacturer’s instructions for the appropriate wind
zone.

2. The replacement windows, doors, or garage doors meet the design

ressure requirements in the most recent version of the Florida Buildin,
Code, Residential.

3. A copy of the manufacturer’s instructions is submitted with the permit
application in a printed or digital format.

4. The replacement windows, doors, or garage doors are the same size

and are installed in the same opening as the existing windows, doors, or
garage doors.

Section 3. Subsection (16) of section 553.79, Florida Statutes, is amended
to read:

553.79 Permits; applications; issuance; inspections.—

CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2024-191 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2024-191

Section 4. Present paragraphs (o) through (r) of subsection (1) and
subsections (10) through (21) of section 553.791, Florida Statutes, are
redesignated as paragraphs (p) through (s) and subsections (11) through
(22), respectively, a new paragraph (o) is added to subsection (1) and a new
subsection (10) is added to that section, and present paragraph (o) of
subsection (1), paragraph (c) of subsection (4), paragraphs (b) and (d) of
subsection (7), subsection (9), paragraph (b) of present subsection (13),
paragraph (b) of present subsection (16), and present subsection (19) are
amended, to read:

553.791 Alternative plans review and inspection.—

(1) As used in this section, the term:

5
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2024-191 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2024-191

(0) “Private provider firm” means a business organization, including a

corporation, partnership, business trust, or other legal entity, which offers
services under this chapter to the public through licensees who are acting as
agents, employees, officers, or partners of the firm. A person who is licensed
as a building code administrator under part XII of chapter 468, an engineer
under chapter 471, or an architect under chapter 481 may act as a private
provider for an agent, employee, or officer of the private provider firm.

(p)e) “Request for certificate of occupancy or certificate of completion”
means a properly completed and executed application for:

1. A certificate of occupancy or certificate of completion.

2. A certificate of compliance from the private provider required under

subsection (13) (2).
3. Any applicable fees.

4. Any documents required by the local building official to determine
that the fee owner has secured all other government approvals required by
law.

(4) A fee owner or the fee owner’s contractor using a private provider to
provide building code inspection services shall notify the local building
official in writing at the time of permit application, or by 2 p.m. local time, 2
business days before the first scheduled inspection by the local building
official or building code enforcement agency that a private provider has been
contracted to perform the required inspections of construction under this
section, including single-trade inspections, on a form to be adopted by the
commission. This notice shall include the following information:

(¢) An acknowledgment from the fee owner or the fee owner’s contractor
in substantially the following form:

I have elected to use one or more private providers to provide building
code plans review and/or inspection services on the building or structure
that is the subject of the enclosed permit application, as authorized by s.
553.791, Florida Statutes. I understand that the local building official
may not review the plans submitted or perform the required building
inspections to determine compliance with the applicable codes, except to
the extent specified in said law. Instead, plans review and/or required
building inspections will be performed by licensed or certified personnel
identified in the application. The law requires minimum insurance
requirements for such personnel, but I understand that I may require
more insurance to protect my interests. By executing this form, I
acknowledge that I have made inquiry regarding the competence of the
licensed or certified personnel and the level of their insurance and am
satisfied that my interests are adequately protected. I agree to
indemnify, defend, and hold harmless the local government, the local
building official, and their building code enforcement personnel from

6
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2024-191 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2024-191

any and all claims arising from my use of these licensed or certified
personnel to perform building code inspection services with respect to
the building or structure that is the subject of the enclosed permit
application.

If the fee owner or the fee owner’s contractor makes any changes to the listed
private providers or the services to be provided by those private providers,
the fee owner or the fee owner’s contractor shall, within 1 business day after
any change or within 2 business days before the next scheduled inspection,
update the notice to reflect such changes. A change of a duly authorized
representative named in the permit application does not require a revision of
the permit, and the building code enforcement agency shall not charge a fee
for making the change.

(7

(b) If the local building official provides a written notice of plan
deficiencies to the permit applicant within the prescribed 20-day period,
the 20-day period shall be tolled pending resolution of the matter. To resolve
the plan deficiencies, the permit applicant may elect to dispute the
deficiencies pursuant to subsection (15) (34) or to submit revisions to correct
the deficiencies.

(d) If the local building official provides a second written notice of plan
deficiencies to the permit applicant within the prescribed time period, the
permit applicant may elect to dispute the deficiencies pursuant to subsection
(15) &4 or to submit additional revisions to correct the deficiencies. For all
revisions submitted after the first revision, the local building official has an
additional 5 business days from the date of resubmittal to issue the
requested permit or to provide a written notice to the permit applicant
stating which of the previously identified plan features remain in noncom-
pliance with the applicable codes, with specific reference to the relevant code
chapters and sections.

(9) A private provider performing required inspections under this section
shall provide notice to the local building official of the approximate date and

appfeaﬂmate tlme of any such 1nspect10n ﬂe—later—bhan—‘eh&pﬂer—b&smessrday

eﬁﬁelal—}n—ﬂaatﬂﬂﬂsdieﬁeﬂ The local bulldmg ofﬁ01al may not proh1b1t the

private provider from performing any inspection outside the local building
official’s normal operating hours, including after hours, weekends, or
holidays. The local building official may visit the building site as often as
necessary to verify that the private provider is performing all required
inspections. A deficiency notice must be posted by the private provider, the
duly authorized representative of the private provider, or the building
department whenever a noncomplying item related to the building code or
the permitted documents is found. Such notice may be physically posted at
the job site or electronically posted. After corrections are made, the item
must be reinspected by the private provider or representative before being

7
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2024-191 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2024-191

concealed. Reinspection or reaudit fees shall not be charged by the local
jurisdiction as a result of the local jurisdiction’s audit inspection occurring
before the performance of the private provider’s inspection or for any other
administrative matter not involving the detection of a violation of the
building code or a permit requirement.

(10) If the private provider is a person licensed as an engineer under
chapter 471 or an architect under chapter 481 and affixes his or her
professional seal to the affidavit required under subsection (6), the local
building official must issue the requested permit or provide a written notice
to the permit applicant identifying the specific plan features that do not
comply with the applicable codes, as well as the specific code chapters and

sections, within 10 business days after receipt of the permit application and
affidavit. In such written notice, the local building official must provide with
specificity the plan’s deficiencies, the reasons the permit application failed,
and the applicable codes being violated. If the local building official does not
provide specific written notice to the permit applicant within the prescribed
10-day period, the permit application is deemed approved as a matter of law,

and the local building official must issue the permit on the next business
day.

(14)13)

(b) Ifthe local building official does not provide notice of the deficiencies
within the applicable time periods under paragraph (a), the request for a
certificate of occupancy or certificate of completion is automatically granted
and deemed issued as of the next business day. The local building official
must provide the applicant with the written certificate of occupancy or
certificate of completion within 10 days after it is automatically granted and
issued. To resolve any identified deficiencies, the applicant may elect to
dispute the deficiencies pursuant to subsection (15) 34) or to submit a
corrected request for a certificate of occupancy or certificate of completion.

(A7)16)

(b) A local enforcement agency, local building official, or local govern-
ment may establish, for private providers, private provider firms, and duly
authorized representatives working within that jurisdiction, a system of
registration to verify compliance with the licensure requirements of
paragraph (1)(n) and the insurance requirements of subsection (18) &47.

(20039 A Eaeh local building code enforcement agency may not audit
the performance of building code inspection services by private providers
operating within the local jurisdiction until the agency has created standard
operating private provider audit procedures for the agency’s internal
inspection and review staff, which includes, at a minimum, the private
provider audit purpose and scope, private provider audit criteria, an
explanation of private provider audit processes and objections, and detailed
findings of areas of noncompliance. Such private provider audit procedures
must be publicly available online and a printed version must be readily

8
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Ch. 2024-191 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2024-191

accessible in agency buildings. The private provider audit results of staff for

the prior two quarters also must be publicly available. The agency’s audit
processes must adhere to the agency’s posted standard operating audit

procedures. Hewever; The same private provider or private provider firm
may not be audited more than four times in a year menth unless the local
building official determines a condition of a building constitutes an
immediate threat to public safety and welfare, which must be communicated
in writing to the private provider or private provider firm. Work on a
building or structure may proceed after 1nspect10n and approval by a private

may shall not be delayed for completlon of an 1nspect10n audit by the local
building code enforcement agency.

Section 5. Subsections (1) and (2) of section 553.792, Florida Statutes,
are amended to read:

553.792 Building permit application to local government.—

(1)(a) A local government must approve, approve with conditions, or
deny a building permit application after receipt of a completed and sufficient
application within the following timeframes, unless the applicant waives
such timeframes in writing:

1. Within 30 business days after receiving a complete and sufficient

application, for an applicant using a local government plans reviewer to
obtain the following building permits if the structure is less than 7,500
square feet: residential units, including a single-family residential unit or a
single-family residential dwelling, accessory structure, alarm, electrical,
irrigation, landscaping, mechanical, plumbing, or roofing.

2. Within 60 business days after receiving a complete and sufficient
application, for an applicant using a local government plans reviewer to
obtain the following building permits if the structure is 7,500 square feet or
more: residential units, including a single-family residential unit or a single-
family residential dwelling, accessory structure, alarm, electrical, irrigation,
landscaping, mechanical, plumbing, or roofing.

3. Within 60 business days after receiving a complete and sufficient
application, for an applicant using a local government plans reviewer to
obtain the following building permits: signs or nonresidential buildings that
are less than 25,000 square feet.

4. Within 60 business days after receiving a complete and sufficient

application, for an applicant using a local government plans reviewer to
obtain the following building permits: multifamily residential, not exceeding
50 units; site-plan approvals and subdivision plats not requiring public

hearing or public notice; and lot grading and site alteration.

9
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.




Ch. 2024-191 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2024-191

5. Within 12 business days after receiving a complete and sufficient

application, for an applicant using a master building permit consistent with
s. 553.794 to obtain a site-specific building permit.

6. Within 10 business days after receiving a complete and sufficient
application, for an applicant for a single-family residential dwelling applied
for by a contractor licensed in this state on behalf of a property owner who
participates in a Community Development Block Grant-Disaster Recovery
program administered by the Department of Commerce, unless the permit
application fails to satisfy the Florida Building Code or the enforcing
agency’s laws or ordinances.

However, the local government may not require the waiver of the time-
frames in this section as a condition precedent to reviewing an applicant’s

building permit application.

(b) Alocal government must meet the timeframes set forth in this section

for reviewing building permit applications unless the timeframes set by local
ordinance are more stringent than those prescribed in this section.

(c) After Within—10-days—of an applicant submits submitting an
application to the local government, the local government must provide
written notice to the applicant within 5 business days after receipt of the
application advising shall-advise the applicant what information, if any, is
needed to deem or determine that the application is properly completed in
compliance with the filing requirements published by the local government.
If the local government does not provide timely written notice that the
applicant has not submitted the properly completed application, the
application is shall be automatically deemed or determined to be properly
completed and accepted %%hm—%—days—&&er—lceeeﬁaﬂg—a—eemﬁle‘eed

’

(d) Alocal government shall maintain on its website a policy containing
procedures and expectations for expedited processing of those building
permits and development orders required by law to be expedited.

10
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2024-191 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2024-191

11
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2024-191 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2024-191

(e)fe) Ifalocal government fails to meet a deadline under this subsection

, it must reduce the building permit fee by
10 percent for each business day that it fails to meet the deadline, unless the
parties agree in writing to a reasonable extension of time, the delay is caused
by the applicant, or the delay is attributable to a force majeure or other
extraordinary circumstances. Each 10-percent reduction shall be based on
the original amount of the building permit fee, unless the parties agree to an
extension of time.

() A local enforcement agency does not have to reduce the building
permit fee if it provides written notice to the applicant by e-mail or United
States Postal Service within the respective timeframes in paragraph (a)
which specifically states the reasons the permit application fails to satisfy

the Florida Building Code or the enforcing agency’s laws or ordinances. The
written notice must also state that the applicant has 10 business days after

receiving the written notice to submit revisions to correct the permit
application and that failure to correct the application within 10 business
days will result in a denial of the application.

(g) If the applicant submits revisions within 10 business days after

receiving the written notice, the local enforcement agency has 10 business
days after receiving such revisions to approve or deny the building permit
unless the applicant agrees to a longer period in writing. If the local
enforcement agency fails to issue or deny the building permit within 10
business days after receiving the revisions, it must reduce the building

permit fee by 20 percent for each business day that it fails to meet the
deadline unless the applicant agrees to a longer period in writing.

12
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2024-191 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2024-191

Section 6. Paragraph (a) of subsection (7) of section 553.80, Florida
Statutes, is amended to read:

553.80 Enforcement.—

(7)a) The governing bodies of local governments may provide a schedule
of reasonable fees, as authorized by s. 125.56(2) or s. 166.222 and this
section, for enforcing this part. These fees, and any fines or investment
earnings related to the fees, may only shall be used selely for carrying out the
local government’s responsibilities in enforcing the Florida Building Code.
When providing a schedule of reasonable fees, the total estimated annual
revenue derived from fees, and the fines and investment earnings related to
the fees, may not exceed the total estimated annual costs of allowable
activities. Any unexpended balances must be carried forward to future years
for allowable activities or must be refunded at the discretion of the local
government. A local government may not carry forward an amount
exceeding the average of its operating budget for enforcing the Florida
Building Code for the previous 4 fiscal years. For purposes of this subsection,
the term “operating budget” does not include reserve amounts. Any amount
exceeding this limit must be used as authorized in subparagraph 2.
However, a local government that established, as of January 1, 2019, a
Building Inspections Fund Advisory Board consisting of five members from
the construction stakeholder community and carries an unexpended balance
in excess of the average of its operating budget for the previous 4 fiscal years
may continue to carry such excess funds forward upon the recommendation
of the advisory board. The basis for a fee structure for allowable activities
must relate to the level of service provided by the local government and must
include consideration for refunding fees due to reduced services based on
services provided as prescribed by s. 553.791, but not provided by the local
government. Fees charged must be consistently applied.

1. As used in this subsection, the phrase “enforcing the Florida Building
Code” includes the direct costs and reasonable indirect costs associated with
review of building plans, building inspections, reinspections, and building
permit processing; building code enforcement; and fire inspections asso-
ciated with new construction. The phrase may also include training costs
associated with the enforcement of the Florida Building Code and enforce-
ment action pertaining to unlicensed contractor activity to the extent not
funded by other user fees.

13
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2024-191 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2024-191

2. A local government must use any excess funds that it is prohibited
from carrying forward to rebate and reduce fees, to upgrade technology
hardware and software systems to enhance service delivery, or to pay for the
construction of a building or structure that houses a local government’s
building code enforcement agency, or for the training programs for building
officials, inspectors, or plans examiners associated with the enforcement of
the Florida Building Code. Excess funds used to construct such a building or
structure must be designated for such purpose by the local government and
may not be carried forward for more than 4 consecutive years. An owner or
builder who has a valid building permit issued by a local government for a
fee, or an association of owners or builders located in the state that has
members with valid building permits issued by a local government for a fee,
may bring a civil action against the local government that issued the permit
for a fee to enforce this subparagraph.

3. The following activities may not be funded with fees adopted for
enforcing the Florida Building Code:

a. Planning and zoning or other general government activities.
b. Inspections of public buildings for a reduced fee or no fee.

c. Public information requests, community functions, boards, and any
program not directly related to enforcement of the Florida Building Code.

d. Enforcement and implementation of any other local ordinance,
excluding validly adopted local amendments to the Florida Building Code
and excluding any local ordinance directly related to enforcing the Florida
Building Code as defined in subparagraph 1.

4. A local government must use recognized management, accounting,
and oversight practices to ensure that fees, fines, and investment earnings
generated under this subsection are maintained and allocated or used solely
for the purposes described in subparagraph 1.

5. The local enforcement agency, independent district, or special district
may not require at any time, including at the time of application for a permit,
the payment of any additional fees, charges, or expenses associated with:

a. Providing proof of licensure under chapter 489;
b. Recording or filing a license issued under this chapter;

c. Providing, recording, or filing evidence of workers’ compensation
insurance coverage as required by chapter 440; or

d. Charging surcharges or other similar fees not directly related to
enforcing the Florida Building Code.

Section 7. Effective July 1, 2025, section 553.9065, Florida Statutes, is
created to read:

14
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2024-191 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2024-191

553.9065 Thermal efficiency standards for unvented attic and unvented
enclosed rafter assemblies.—

(1) Unvented attic and unvented enclosed rafter assemblies that are

insulated and air sealed with a minimum of R-20 air-impermeable

insulation meet the requirements of sections R402 of the Florida Building
Code, 8th Edition (2023), Energy Conservation, if all of the following apply:

(a) The building has a blower door test result of less than 3 ACH50.

(b) The building has a positive input ventilation system or a balanced or
hybrid whole-house mechanical ventilation system.

(¢) If the insulation is installed below the roof deck and the exposed
portion of roof rafters is not already covered by the R-20 air-impermeable
insulation, the exposed portion of the roof rafters is insulated by a minimum
of R-3 air-impermeable insulation unless directly covered by a finished

ceiling. Roof rafters are not required to be covered by a minimum of R-3 air-
impermeable insulation if continuous insulation is installed above the roof

deck.

(d) All indoor heating, cooling, and ventilation equipment and ductwork
is inside the building thermal envelope.

(2) The commission shall review and consider this section and any

technical changes thereto and report such findings to the Legislature by
December 31, 2024.

Section 8. Section 440.103, Florida Statutes, is amended to read:

440.103 Building permits; identification of minimum premium policy.
Every employer shall, as a condition to applying for and receiving a building
permit, show proof and certify to the permit issuer that it has secured
compensation for its employees under this chapter as provided in ss. 440.10
and 440.38. Such proof of compensation must be evidenced by a certificate of
coverage issued by the carrier, a valid exemption certificate approved by the
department, or a copy of the employer’s authority to self-insure and shall be
presented, electronically or physically, each time the employer applies for a
building permit. As provided in s. 553.79(23) s--553.79(24), for the purpose of
inspection and record retention, site plans or building permits may be
maintained at the worksite in the original form or in the form of an electronic
copy. These plans and permits must be open to inspection by the building
official or a duly authorized representative, as required by the Florida
Building Code. As provided in s. 627.413(5), each certificate of coverage must
show, on its face, whether or not coverage is secured under the minimum
premium provisions of rules adopted by rating organizations licensed
pursuant to s. 627.221. The words “minimum premium policy” or equivalent
language shall be typed, printed, stamped, or legibly handwritten.

15
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



Ch. 2024-191 LAWS OF FLORIDA Ch. 2024-191

Section 9. Except as otherwise expressly provided in this act and except
for this section, which shall take effect upon this act becoming a law, this act
shall take effect January 1, 2025.

Approved by the Governor May 16, 2024.
Filed in Office Secretary of State May 16, 2024.

16
CODING: Words stricken are deletions; words underlined are additions.



